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AMBULANCE

My name is Ambulance.

A medically equipped emergency vehicle 
used to transport for sick or hurt people to 

hospitals.

I have a siren on my top which produces 
sound to alert other vehicles to give way
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FIRE TRUCK

My name is Fire Truck or Fire Engine.

I’ll transport firefighters and carry 
equipment for firefighting operations.

I have a siren which produces sound to 
alert other vehicles to give way
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GARBAGE TRUCK

My name is Garbage or Rubbish Truck.

I’ll collect waste and then take it to a waste 
site such as a landfill.

Can collect waste from the front, side or 
back of the truck
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POLICE CAR

My name is Police Car.

A motor vehicle used by police and used to 
assist with their duties in patrolling and 

responding to incidents .

I’ve siren on my head which produces 
sound to alert other vehicles to give way
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PARACHUTE

My name is Parachute.

It is often an umbrella shaped device on 
which people or things can float slowly and 

safely down to the ground from a great 
height, such as an aircraft.

Parachutes are used in a sport called 
skydiving
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TOW TRUCK

My name is Tow Truck or Wrecker.

I will lift and tow broken cars/trucks and 
carry them to garage.

They usually have a boom with a cable to 
carry the broken vehicles
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TAXI

My name is TAXI.

A car, or other vehicle which is used for 
public transport. People use them to get to 

where they want to go.

More the distance you travel, more the fare 
you pay
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BULLDOZER

My name is Bulldozer.

These machines are used for pushing large 
amounts of dirt or rubble during demolition 

or construction

Used in road building, construction, mining, 
forestry, land clearing and infrastructure 

development
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EXCAVATOR

My name is Excavator.

Used to dig in the ground or to move large 
objects, used mainly in Construction.

The operator sits in a cab and controls the 
excavator.

https://www.pappucreativespace.com/


https://www.pappucreativespace.com/

CRANE

My name is Crane.

It is mainly used for lifting heavy things and 
transporting them to other places

Commonly employed in the construction 
industry for the movement of materials, 

and in the manufacturing industry for the 
assembling of heavy equipment

https://www.pappucreativespace.com/


https://www.pappucreativespace.com/

DUMP TRUCK

My name is Dump Truck or Tipper. 

Have an open-top box bed with an opening 
"tail-gate" door on the back.

Carries sand, gravel, and dirt, mostly 
employed in construction area
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ROAD ROLLER

My name is Road Roller.

A vehicle used to compact soil, gravel, 
concrete, or asphalt in the construction of 

roads and foundations.

Similar rollers are used also at landfills or in 
agriculture

Frequently referred to as steamrollers. 
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CONCRETE MIXER

My name is Concrete or Cement Mixer.

Combines cement, aggregate such as sand 
or gravel, and water to form concrete.

Uses a revolving drum to mix the 
components, mostly employed in 

construction sites
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BACKHOE LOADER

My name is Backhoe Loader.

Contains loader-style shovel/bucket on the 
front and a backhoe on the back.

Very commonly used in demolition and 
small construction projects
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